
Curriculum Content 

 

GCSE Y10-11 (Business) 

Exam Board: Pearson Edexcel  

Exam Board Specification: 1BS0 

Weblink: Edexcel GCSE Business (2017) | Pearson qualifications 

Year 10 Topics Year 11 Topics 
 
Theme 1: ‘Investigating Small 
Business’ 
 

• Enterprise & Entrepreneurship 
(Yr 9)  

• Spotting a business opportunity 

• Putting a business idea into 
practice 

• Making the business effective 

• Understanding external 
influences on business 

 
 

 
Theme 2: ‘Building a Business: 
 

• Growing the business 

• Making marketing decisions 

• Making operational decisions 

• Making financial decisions 
 

 

A Level Y12 & Y13 (Business) 

Exam Board: AQA 

Exam Board Specification: 7132 

Weblink: AQA | Business | AS and A-level | Business 

Year 12 Topics Year 13 Topics 
 

• What is business?  

• Managers, leadership and 
decision making 

• Decision making to improve 
marketing performance  

• Decision making to improve 
operational performance 

• Decision making to improve 
financial performance  

• Decision making to improve 
human resource performance  
 

 

• Analysing the strategic position 
of a business 

• Choosing strategic direction 
(Year 2) 

• Strategic methods: how to 
pursue strategies 

• Managing strategic change  
 

https://qualifications.pearson.com/en/qualifications/edexcel-gcses/business-2017.html
https://www.aqa.org.uk/subjects/business/as-and-a-level/business-7131-7132


A Level Y12 & Y13 (Economics) 

Exam Board: AQA 

Exam Board Specification: 7132 

Weblink: AQA | AS and A-level | Economics | Specification at a glance 

Year 12 Topics Year 13 Topics 
 

• Economic methodology and the 
economic problem 

• Individual economic decision 
making 

• Price determination in a 
competitive market 

• The market mechanism, market 
failure and government 
intervention in markets 

• Economic performance 

• The measurement of 
macroeconomic performance 

• How the macroeconomy works : 
the circular flow of income, 
AD/AS analysis, and related 
concepts 

• Fiscal policy and supply-side 
 

 

• Financial markets and monetary 
policy 

• Production, costs and revenue  

• Perfect competition, imperfectly 
competitive markets and 
monopoly 

• The labour market 

• The distribution of income and 
wealth: poverty and inequality 
 

 

 

 

https://www.aqa.org.uk/subjects/economics/as-and-a-level/economics-7135-7136/specification-at-a-glance

